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Awesome Creator

Genesis 1:1-13


For the Week of September 12, 2021


Getting Started

1. What insight, principle, or observation from this 
weekend’s message did you find to be the most helpful, 
eye-opening, or troubling?


2. What is the most spectacular thing that you have ever 
created?


3. What is the most spectacular thing that you have ever 
experienced in God’s creation?

The Heart of the Matter

12. According to Romans 1:20-25, what should be your 
response to God’s creative power?


13. What aspect of the created world is the most inspiring 
to you?


 


14. What difference does it make in your life that you know 
that you were created and designed by God?  

  


15. Who do you need to share these things with? Ask God 
to give you an opportunity right now.  
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8. How are Genesis 1:1 and John 1:1 related? What is the 
main connecting idea between these two verses? 


9. Throughout the New Testament Jesus Christ is put 
forward as the Creator. What do these passages say about 
this truth? (John 1:3; 1:10; 5:17-19; Ephesians 3:8-9; 
Colossians 1:13-17; Hebrews 1:2-3; Revelation 4:11) 


10. How reliable is the Biblical account of creation? On 
what do you base your answer? (II Timothy 3:16; II Peter 
1:20) 

11. In the book of Acts, the Apostle Paul usually began with 
the Genesis account when he taught the Gentiles. Why do 
you think he did this? (Acts 14:15; 17:24) 

Digging Deeper

4. Why do you think the writer of Genesis, Moses, begins 
the book the way he does? 

5. What is significant about what God created in verse 1? 
 


6. In Ephesians 1:4 what does the Scripture say was the 
wondrous work of God before He created the world? 
 


7. What is God’s ultimate purpose in creating the world? 
(Psalm 19:1ff; 150:1-2; 89:5; 97:6; 148:3; I Chronicles 
16:31; Job 36:24; Isaiah 6:3; 40:26) 


